
Some Relevant Paragraphs from the Book of Discipline

¶ 138.
We recognize that God made all creation and saw that it was good. As a diverse people of God 
who bring special gifts and evidences of God’s grace to the unity of the Church and to society, 
we are called to be faithful to the example of Jesus’ ministry to all persons.

Inclusiveness means openness, acceptance, and support that enables all persons to participate 
in the life of the Church, the community, and the world. Thus, inclusiveness denies every 
semblance of discrimination.

The mark of an inclusive society is one in which all persons are open, welcoming, fully 
accepting, and supporting of all other persons, enabling them to participate fully in the life of the 
church, the community, and the world. A further mark of inclusiveness is the setting of church 
activities in facilities accessible to persons with disabilities.

In The United Methodist Church inclusiveness means the freedom for the total involvement of all
persons who meet the requirements of The United Methodist Book of Discipline in the 
membership and leadership of the Church at any level and in every place. In the spirit of this 
declaration, United Methodist seminaries will make all efforts to meet Americans with Disabilities
(ADA) accessibility standards by the year 2011. Exemptions for historical or existing buildings 
are not allowed under this requirement.

¶ 161G.
Homosexual persons no less than heterosexual persons are individuals of sacred worth. All 
persons need the ministry and guidance of the church in their struggles for human fulfillment, as
well as the spiritual and emotional care of a fellowship that enables reconciling relationships 
with God, with others, and with self. Although we do not condone the practice of homosexuality 
and consider this practice incompatible with Christian teaching, we affirm that God’s grace is 
available to all. We implore families and churches not to reject or condemn their lesbian and gay
members and friends. We commit ourselves to be in ministry for and with all persons.

¶ 162H.
Certain basic human rights and civil liberties are due all persons.  We are committed to 
supporting those rights and liberties for homosexual persons.  We see a clear issue of simple 
justice in protecting their rightful claims where they have shared material resources, pensions, 
guardian relationships, mutual powers of attorney, and other such lawful claims typically 
attendant to contractual relationships that involve shared contributions, responsibilities, and 
liabilities, and equal protection before the law.  Moreover, we support efforts to stop violence 
and other forms of coercion against gays and lesbians.  We also commit ourselves to social 
witness against the coercion and marginalization of former homosexuals.

¶ 304.3.
3. While persons set apart by the Church for ordained ministry are subject to all the frailties of 
the human condition and the pressures of society, they are required to maintain the highest 
standards of holy living in the world. Since the practice of homosexuality is incompatible with 
Christian teaching, self-avowed practicing homosexuals are not to be accepted as candidates, 
ordained as ministers, or appointed to serve in The United Methodist Church.



¶ 306.4f.
f) agree for the sake of the mission of Jesus Christ in the world and the most effective witness of
the gospel, and in consideration of their influence as ministers, to make a complete dedication 
of themselves to the highest ideals of the Christian life as set forth in ¶¶ 102–104; 160–166. To 
this end they shall agree to exercise responsible self-control by personal habits conducive to 
bodily health, mental and emotional maturity, fidelity in marriage and celibacy in singleness, 
social responsibility, and growth in grace and the knowledge and love of God. 

[see also footnote 2: The General Conference, in response to expressions throughout the 
Church regarding homosexuality and ordination, reaffirms the present language of the Discipline
regarding the character and commitment of persons seeking ordination and affirms its high 
standards.]

¶ 332.6.
Ceremonies that celebrate homosexual unions shall not be conducted by our ministers and shall
not be conducted in our churches.

¶ 806.9.
It [the General Council on Finance and Administration] shall be responsible for ensuring that no 
board, agency, committee, commission, or council shall give United Methodist funds to any gay 
caucus or group, or otherwise use such funds to promote the acceptance of homosexuality.  
The council shall have the right to stop such expenditures.  This restriction shall not limit the 
Church’s ministry in response to the HIV epidemic.


